
Company website: www.wasserstrom.com 

Contact: Joan Payne 

Phone: (614) 737-8496 OR 800-999-9277 ext. 8177 

Fax:  (614) 737-3165 

Email: joanpayne@wasserstrom.com 

Ordering Conditions: $150.00 minimum for free delivery 

NET 30 days 

Address: 477 South Front St., Columbus, OH 43215 



 

NO DESCRIPTION

PRODUCT

 NUMBER UNIT BRAND NAME PRICE

1 Aprons - Bib with 3 compartment front 122861 28 x 30" San Jamar $3.42

pockets, full length, poly/cotton

2 Aprons - Cobbler, 65/35 poly/cotton 78505020 6/'32x34" Arden/Benhar $4.63

1 ct

3 Coffee Maker - automatic percolators 70116618 36 cup Focus $90.29

70116609 55 cup Focus $140.31

70116612 100 cup Focus $156.44

4 Airpot with stainless steel exterior each

2.2 liter with pump lid 211923 Service Ideas $44.03

2.2 liter with lever lid 346521 Service Ideas $51.34

5 Cutting boards, USDA accepted to comply 126700 12x18x.5 Carlisle $12.81

with FDA regulations, made from white, high- 126212 15x20x.5 Carlisle $26.91

density polyethylene 122602 18x24x.5 Carlisle $36.78

6 Cutting boards, flexible plastic N/A 11 1/2 x 15 no bid

N/A 18 x 24 no bid

N/A 7 1/2 x 11 ½ no bid

 

7 Cutting boards, color coded 648247 6/12 x 18 San Jamar $100.49/st

Please list all colors available 648246 18 x 24 San Jamar $143.47/st

Storage stand, will hold 6 boards 648233 each San Jamar $45.10

Please include chart for what each color is

used for

8 Fast Food Trays - Cambros or equal, list

colors available                         24/case 284316 10 5/8 x 13.75 Cambro $23.52/dz

                                                  24/case 282103 12 x 16 Cambro $28.22/dz

                                                  12/case 281212 14 x 18 Cambro $35.95/dz

9 School Lunch Trays, 6 compartment trays

Left hand compartment trays with three 721840 10 x 15 Cambro $96.10/cs

smaller upper compartment, two larger lower

compartments (one round, one rectangular), 281727 10 x 14 Cambro $90.72/cs

and a flatware holder on left, 12/case

Cambro or Carlisle or equal



 

NO DESCRIPTION

PRODUCT

 NUMBER UNIT BRAND NAME PRICE

10 Flatware - medium weight

dinner fork 212252 2 dozen World Tableware $1.76/dz

dinner knife 212256 1 dozen World Tableware $3.78/dz

 teaspoon 212251 3 dozen World Tableware $1.08/dz

11 Knives -  

Cook's knife 112612 8" blade Dexter Russell $10.91

Hamburger turner 220900 4" x 2.5" Dexter Russell $20.76

Mini turner 204409 2.5" Dexter Russell $11.49

Paring knife 216403 3.25" Dexter Russell $2.73

Pizza cutter 220520 2.5" Dexter Russell $15.09

Pizza cutter 220510 4" Dexter Russell $17.54

Potato peeler 123600 1 Anchor Hocking $1.33

Sandwich spreader 219901 3.5" Dexter Russell $7.71

Utility knife - scalloped 220100 5" Dexter Russell $10.93

Utility knife - scalloped 219811 9" Dexter Russell $16.35

12 Measuring cups - clear, polycarbonate with 135336 1 cup Newell Rubbermaid $4.76

handle 135901 1 quart Newell Rubbermaid $9.10

135330 4 quart Newell Rubbermaid $13.58

13 Pot holders

8" x 8" terry N/A 6 ct sold by each

8" x 8" terry 122511 1 ct San Jamar $1.61

insulated heavy duty, 8.5x11.5" N/A pair no bid

baker's pads with steam barrier N/A each no bid

oven mitts with steam barrier - 17" 118087 pair San Jamar $8.51

14 Rubber scrapers 124100 9.5" Newell Rubbermaid $1.68

124200 13.5" Newell Rubbermaid $2.94

124201 16.5" Newell Rubbermaid $3.92

15 Serving Utensils - Dishers (color coded) 289899 #6 Vollrath $8.19

With insulated handles 289900 #8 Vollrath $8.19

290000 #10 Vollrath $8.19

290100 #12 Vollrath $8.19

290200 #16 Vollrath $8.19

290300 #24 Vollrath $8.19

290400 #30 Vollrath $8.19

290500 #40 Vollrath $8.19



 

NO DESCRIPTION

PRODUCT

 NUMBER UNIT BRAND NAME PRICE

16 Serving Utensils - Dishers - Universal 290100 #12 Vollrath $8.61

Accommodates right or left hand users 290210 #16 Vollrath $8.61

210501 #40 Vollrath $8.61

290600 #60 Vollrath $8.61

292800 #70 Vollrath $8.61

293100 #100 Vollrath $8.61

 

17 Serving Utensils - Ladles

    Handles                   9.25" 251002 1/2 oz Vollrath $1.26

                                      9.25" 251003 1 oz Vollrath $1.51

                                    11" 259605 2 oz Vollrath $1.83

                                    13" 251005 4 oz Vollrath $2.46

                                    13" 251006 6 oz Vollrath $3.15

                                    13" 151007 8 oz Vollrath $4.16

18 Serving Utensils - Slotted Spoons 208006 13" Vollrath $1.76

With insulated handle 210802 13.25" Vollrath $3.53

19 Serving Utensils - Spoodle - regular 259926 2 oz Vollrath $8.13

With insulated handles 259946 3 oz Vollrath $8.13

259927 4 oz Vollrath $8.13

259948 6 oz Vollrath $8.20

259949 8 oz Vollrath $9.14

20 Serving Utensils - Spoodle - slotted 259925 2 oz Vollrath $8.13

With insulated handles 259942 3 oz Vollrath $8.13

259924 4 oz Vollrath $8.13

259947 6 oz Vollrath $8.20

259923 8 oz Vollrath $9.14

21 Thermometers   - Oven 113169  +60/580 Fluke Electronics $3.01

Refrigerator/Freezer 113192  -40/+120 Taylor $2.83

Test - not adjustable 113170  0/+220 Fluke Electronics $2.66

Test - adjustable 113561 0/+220 Taylor $7.71

Stick disposable thermometer N/A 250

Test strip for temperature for dishwasher N/A 1 roll no bid

22 Thermometers - Cooling N/A each no bid

Coolit-Rite by Cooper or equal



 

NO DESCRIPTION

PRODUCT

 NUMBER UNIT BRAND NAME PRICE

23 Timers, 1 hour x 1 minute N/A 1 no bid

24 Tongs -      one piece plastic 272721 6" Carlisle $1.22

                  one piece plastic - 1 ct 273733 9" Carlisle $1.93

one piece plastic - 6 ct N/A 9" sold by each

                  one piece metal 273698 6" Vollrath $1.50

specify color - clear or black on plastic

25 Tongs -      two piece metal 273104 9" Vollrath $2.02

                  two piece metal 273105 12" Vollrath $2.20

26 Towels -  Herringbone weave 118062 12 - 15x26" San Jamar $11.35/dz

                Ribbed bar 384784 12 - 16x19" San Jamar $12.81/dz

27 Squeegee 101652 12" Carlisle $7.25

601314 18" Unger Enterprises $14.91

28 Sanitizing bucket, red 125702 6 qt San Jamar $3.71

125706 8 qt San Jamar $5.17

29 Sanitizing bucket, green for soap solutions 122613 6 qt San Jamar $3.71


